Kerr Brown

From: Roddy, Frank (GAMING) <Frank.Roddy@gaming.ny.gov>

Sent: 18 April 2014 12:14

To: Kerr Brown

Cc: Michael Treanor; Willi, Bob (GAMING)

Subject: RE: NYS Gaming Commission Application Fee for Nevele-R LLC
Kerr,

This notice is to confirm that the NYS Gaming Commission has received your $1 million application fee. Thank you.

Frank Roddy
Administrative Officer, CFO
NYS Gaming Commission
One Broadway Center
Schenectady, NY 12305
(518) 388-3354

From: Kerr Brown [mailto:kbrown@claremontplc.com]

Sent: Friday, April 18, 2014 11:16 AM

To: Roddy, Frank (GAMING)

Cc: Michael Treanor

Subject: NYS Gaming Commission Application Fee for Nevele-R LLC

Frank

Reference my earlier call, | have today wire transferred two tranches of $500,000 to your Commercial Gaming Revenue
Acct at Key Bank as instructed in your mail of April 10.

The name of the entity making the application to apply for a license to develop and operate a gaming facility in New
York State is Nevele-R, LLC.

Kind regards
Kerr

Kerr Brown | EVP Controller
Nevele Resort, Casino & Spa
Government Center, 5th Floor
Ellenville, NY 12428
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